



CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 18-3568 SUMMARY

February 5, 2019 @ 10:00a.m.

Demolition and Site Clearance of 4 Locations	A Demolition	Sonny Fulmer	CHF	RCI Construction
<i>Present at Bid Opening</i>	No	No	Yes	No
<i>5% Bid Bond</i>	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
<b>524 Gardenia</b>	5,000.00	6,500.00	No Bid	7,200.00
<b>1323 Franklin</b>	4,000.00	4,500.00	No Bid	8,800.00
<b>4132 East Washington</b>	20,000.00	No Bid	140,000.00	30,000.00
<b>2119 West 16<sup>th</sup> Street</b>	4,200.00	7,500.00	No Bid	9,100.00
<i>Additional Information</i>				

Opened by: Amy Smith  
Summary by: Crystal Willis



CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 18-3568 SUMMARY

February 5, 2019 @ 10:00a.m.

Demolition and Site Clearance of 4 Locations	Hart Contractors	Fureigh	G Hoops & Son	
<i>Present at Bid Opening</i>	No	No	No	
<i>5% Bid Bond</i>	Yes	Yes	Yes	
<b>524 Gardenia</b>	7,380.00	No Bid	6,900.00	
<b>1323 Franklin</b>	3,540.00	No Bid	5,100.00	
<b>4132 East Washington</b>	13,194.00	13,000.00	38,237.00	
<b>2119 West 16<sup>th</sup> Street</b>	3,573.00	4,900.00	8,800.00	
<i>Additional Information</i>				

Opened by: Amy Smith  
Summary by: Crystal Willis